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Abstract 
A so-called 'new' conservation of community-based resource management attempts to 
address issues of equity and rural development by creating pathways whereby local 
'communities' can benefit from, and ultimately hold decision-making power over, wildlife 
resources. As such, it is celebrated as a radical departure from the exclusive, centralised 
and alienating 'fortress' conservation practices of the past. In this paper I contend that 
'new' conservation is not the qualitatively different ideology or practice that it purports to 
be. My analysis is based on the emerging communal area 'conservancies' ofNamibia' s 
USAID-funded Community-Based Natural Resources Management (CBNRM) programme, 
internationally acclaimed as southern Africa's most progressive, people-centred 
conservation initiative. My discussion begins with an alternative framing of the 
conservancy model as the continuation of a northern concern for the preservation of 
threatened large mammal species, albeit in a rather more politically-correct world where 
the blatant alienation of people from resources is no longer acceptable. Divergences 
between national and local objectives become apparent when considering the different 
ways in which debate over conservancy establishment is articulated: namely, that while 
presented nationally as a policy enabling decentralisation of rights to animal wildlife, it has 
been appropriated locally as a forum for expressing and contesting claims to land in a 
context of gross inequity in land distribution. The paper moves on to critique some of the 
claims made for the success of community-based conservation initiatives in Namibia under 
the rubric of conservancy formation: first, that the anticipated diversification of incomes 
will improve livelihood sustainability; second, that decision-making processes are 
representative and participatory; and third, that conservancies per se provide an enabling 
environment for the empowerment of disadvantaged people. Throughout, and as apparently 
identified by local people themselves, tensions existing between individual aspirations and 
differences, particularly in relation to gender and ethnicity, are made explicit. A donor-led 
equalising of 'other' people as 'communities' thus displaces both individual 
entrepreneurial initiative and priorities not held by those who become ascendant in the 
hierarchies of CBNRM institutions. Despite both the emancipatory rhetoric of current 
environment and development discourse, and the specific context of a 'successful' 
community-based conservation initiative, it seems that a more realistic (and honest) 
reframing of 'new' conservation is required: as the fine-tuning of an existing status quo of 
inequality in the global and national distribution of capital; as a shifting of the costs of 
conservation onto communal area residents; and as driven by a preservationist concern for 
saving a spectacular fauna of 'the south'. 
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Introduction 

. 'We have also come to understan<;l. and realize that many of 
. I 

the . . . people who came to introduce the Act to us, are the 
former all-white employees of your Ministry who as 
individuals resigned from Government to venture into private 
sector businesses'. 

The above quote is from a letter to the Minister of Environment and Tourism (MET), 
Namibia, sent in June 1999. It was written by two residents of southern Kunene Region 
who some time ago each applied for a formal Permission to Occupy Land (PT0)2 to 
establish campsites and thereby capitalise on an increasing flow of tourists to the area 
following independence in 19903. Their immediate complaint is that the granting of all 
such applications has been put on hold following a request to this effect by the local 
'conservancy committee ' in July 1998. More revealing, however, is the rationale behind 
their complaint: that how can this hold on local entrepreneurial activity be justified when 
national policy vis a vis conservation in communal areas has been largely driven by 
expatriates, many of whom are themselves currently employed in the private sector. This is 
coupled with serious allegations levelled at the 'legality and authority' of the conservancy 
committee. First, that it is comprised largely of persons in the employ of the primary 
implementing agency, the non-government organisation (NGO) Integrated Rural 
Development and Nature Conservation (IRDNC), and who are considered as not 
independent of this organisation and its interests. Second, that it was not democratically 
elected and is therefore unconstitutional. And third, that its election excluded involvement 
of other authorities, namely members of the 'traditional' leadership and the Regional 
Council. 

It is typical for many reviews of a 'new' conservation focusing on community benefits and 
empowerment to celebrate its departure from the 'fortress conservation' typical of the 
past4 . As such, each initiative is evaluated according to the extent to which it can be 
portrayed as 'participatory ' and decentralised in terms of decision-making and revenue 
distribution, while maintaining wildlife conservation ideals5. Recent analyses of 'new' 
conservation which identify state, society (including ' communities' ) and the market as the 
three key actors, the combination of which determines 'success' 6, thus completely avoid 
consideration and deconstruction of the ideological context the 'new' conservation 
supports. 

As apparently identified by recipients, however, the 'new' conservation can also be viewed 
as a qualitatively similar continuation of past conservation policies: in terms of who is 
driving and implementing policy and in the ways in which local difference and aspirations 
are masked by the associated 'communalising ' rhetoric. Even among the apparently more 
progressive United States Agency for International Development (USAID) funded 
Community-Based Natural Resources Management (CBNRM) programmes of southern 
Africa, murmurs of dissent are audible7. Matenga claims, for example, that the decade-long 
ADMADE (Administrative Management Design) programme in Zambia, far from being a 
dramatic departure from previous policy, ' . .. is just a modernization project in the wildlife 
sector designed not to improve economic livelihoods of local communities but to defuse 
local opposition towards national wildlife conservation' 8. On occasion, this is explicitly 
how implementers oriented towards wildlife conservation have appropriated the CBNRM 
approach: as Taylor reports that '[o]ne ofthe expatriate NRMP team members in Botswana 
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admitted informally that their real aim is conservation, and-community development is 
included as a means to achieve this' 9. This seems to be mirrored by local understandings of 
CBNRM programmes as compensation for a continuing lack of real control over wildlife 
resources. As Patel contends in an analysis oflocal perceptions of Zimbabwe's famous 
CAMPFIRE (Communal Area Management Programme for Indigenous Resources) 
programme, villagers from five districts considered the wildlife sector to remain in the 
control of' ... a distant "white" force, in which the safari operator and his clients yield the 
ultimate power', thus bolstering ' ... the economic and political power of minority whites in 
Zimbabwe' rather than constituting meaningful local empowerment10. This view is echoed 
by the desperately poor Tembo-Mvura of north Zimbabwe, where it is compounded by 
ethnic tensions as evidenced by statements such as the following that 'CAMPFIRE is a 
programme for the Chikunda and the Safari people. They are the ones who gain from it. 
What CAMPFIRE does is to stop us from hunting so that white people can come from far 
away to kill animals for fun. We have heard that these people pay money but we have 
never seen any of it. ... All the village wild life committee is made up of the Chikunda' 11 • 

Displacement in these contexts becomes something more subtle than the physical eviction 
of peoples from their land in the name of conservation. It is about the manner in which 
local, multilayered narratives of, and rights to, land and resources are displaced in global 
discourses which survive only by excluding such complexity; and about how local 
differences can constitute distinct relations of disadvantage, enhanced in ways which are 
masked by such normalising discourses. Emerging analyses are thus concluding that ' ... 
while these projects were in theory supposed to empower the local communities through 
their participation in the management and sharing in the benefits of wildlife related 
activities, their participation has proven to be elusive, ... leading to their disempowerment 
economically, socially, psychologically and politically' 12. 

In Namibia, a 'conservancy policy' for communal areas has been developed as the basis for 
community-based conservation through devolved management of wildlife without moving 
people from the land 13. This policy enables communal area residents, as conservancy 
members, to benefit from, and have management responsibilities for, animal wildlife. As a 
wildlife management institution, a conservancy requires a defined boundary and 
membership, a representative management committee, a legal constitution and a plan for 
the equitable distribution of benefits 14• ·Like the much publicised CAMPFIRE programme 
of Zimbabwe- the blueprint for other USAID-funded natural resource management 
programmes throughout southern Africa- the assumption informing conservancy policy is 
that ' ... conservation and development goals can be achieved by creating strong collective 
tenure over wildlife resources in communal lands' 15 . Community-based conservation thus 
is driven by recognition of the costs experienced by farmers living alongside wildlife in 
these areas and the apparent lack of economic incentives for local people to maintain a 
benign relationship to animal wildlife. As in CBNRM programmes elsewhere, the primary 
'facilitators' are NGOs. In the Namibian case, this role falls primarily to IRDNC which, as 
a recent evaluation by its major funders (WWF-US) makes clear, has' ... a particular onus 
... to facilitate conservancy registration and development' 16. 

Namibia's conservancy folicy has been heralded as the most progressive initiative of its 
kind in southern Africa1 . In September 1998 Namibia became the first country worldwide 
to be honoured for a people-centred environmental initiative with the World Wide Fund for 
Nature's (WWF) Gift to the Earth Award18. It is claimed variously that conservancies will 
improve livelihood sustainability through diversification of incomes19; that they <lee based 
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on a participatory decision-making process that is empowering to women20; and that they 
will ' . . . empower poor, disadvantaged rural people'21. This rhetoric, however, exists for 
Namibia in a near absence of independent and data-driven evaluation and critique, · 
particularly with regard to local experiences and perceptions of CBNRM-related projects. 

In this paper I wish to use the particular context of the establishment ofNamibian 
communal-area conservancies to draw attention to several issues underlying a general 
internationally-led agenda of 'community-based conservation'. My discussion begins with 
an alternative framing of the conservancy model as a continuation of a 'northern' concern 
for the preservation of threatened large mammal species, where the blatant exclusion of 
people from resources is no longer acceptable. Divergences between national and local 
objectives become apparent when considering the different ways in which debate regarding 
conservancy establishment has been articulated: namely, that instead of being pursued as a 
policy enabling greater community rights to animal wildlife it has been appropriated 
locally as a forum for expressing and contesting claims to land. The paper moves on to 
critique assertions of the success of CBNRM initiatives in Namibia under the rubric of 
conservancy formation. By default, I focus on reviews by Jones22 who, as both the former 
Ministry of Environment and Tourism officer (MET) responsible for the national CBNRM 
programme and currently a consultant in 'environment and development', has authored 
much of the available material on 'new' policy and practice inN amibia. The specific 
claims discussed are: first, that the anticipated diversification of incomes will improve 
livelihood sustainability; second, that decision-making processes are representative and 
participatory; and third, that conservancies per se provide an enabling environment for the 
empowerment of disadvantaged people. Throughout, and as apparently identified by local 
people themselves, I wish to make explicit the tensions which exist between individual 
aspirations and differences, and in relation to an equalising discourse of' community' . A 
donor-led categorisation of 'other' people as 'communities', and the subsequent discussion 
of these as meaningful 'entities', thus can both strangle individual initiative and mask 
priorities not held by those ascendant in the hierarchies of CBNRM institutions. With 
regard to the latter, my aim is to explore ways in which general structural tendencies and 
metanarratives, in this case an unproblematised ideal of 'community', can foster 
inequalities. At risk myself of essentialising categories, I focus here on gender and 
ethnicity as significant shared axes of difference with implications for participation and 
representation in project conceptualisation and implementation. 

Conservancies and continuities: moulding an ethic of wildlife preservation to a post-
apartheid context 
Significantly, conservancies evolved in the 1970s in an apartheid-structured South Africa 
as a means of consolidating exclusive rights over animal wildlife by white settler farmers, 
largely through the employment of game guards to militate against 'poaching' by black 
African 'neighbours'23 . Furthering the 'ecological apartheid' of the protected area system, 
conservancies were seen as the only ' . . . viable alternative for the salvation of wildlife on 
private land' in a context where it was considered that '[f]ailure to provide security and 
management for wildlife on private land must, inevitably, lead to its demise' 24. 

In Namibia, the conservancy concept similarly emerged in the context of commercial 
farmland. Here, since 1968 and subject to certain conditions set by the MET, particularly 
with regard to fencing, European settler farmers have had legal rights to consumptively and 
otherwise utilise animal wildlife on their farms25 . Under these circumstances lancfo.wners 
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' ... realised that it is advantageous to pool their lwd and financial resources to make 
available a larger unit on which integrated management practices can be carried out' 26 . 

Some 12 conservancies now exist on freehold land. Vvnile acknowledged and supported by 
27 . the MET, these have no legal status to date . 

Alongside this strengthening of rights over land and wildlife by settler farmers on freehold 
land, growing concern was being expressed by conservationists regarding the future of 
animal wildlife in the Namibia's communally-managed indigenous 'homelands'. A 
particular focus of this anxiety was the Kaokoveld of north-west Namibia; the imagined 
'last wilderness' of South African environmentalists28, and the world-famous birthplace of 
Namibian community-based conservation. Here, large-scale losses in the 1970s and 1980s 
of internationally-valued large mammal species, particularly desert-dwelling elephant 
(Loxodonta africana) and black rhino (Diceros bicornis bicornis), provided an impetus to 
enlist the support of local people for the conservation process29 . Initially, this was led by 
individuals spearheading the privately-funded conservation charity the Namibian Wildlife 
Trust (NWT). This organisation, via a somewhat circuitous route, has evolved into IRDNC, 
the N GO currently responsible for implementation of much of the activities falling under 
Namibia's CBNRM program. 

The reasons for the 1970s and 1980s wildlife losses are many and complex. In the 1960s 
the area was exploited essentially as a private hunting reserve by top government officials, 
including Cabinet Ministers in the South African govemment30. In the 1970s, it appears 
that ' . .. the majority of men appointed to safeguard the Kaokoveld embarked on a hunting 
frenzy' 31 . In the late 1970s and early 1980s devastating drought caused wildlife losses, both 
directly and through stimulating local 'poaching' in attempts to counter erosion oflocal 
pastoralist livelihoods. It seems likely, however, that the desert elephant and rhino of north-
west Namibia were reduced primarily as part of organised regional illegal trafficking in 
ivory and horn during the 1980s. This is known to have been pursued as a ' ... deliberate 
policy of the various organs of the South African state', including white South African 
military personnel32. As Ellis argues, although outwardly successful in conserving its own 
wildlife, the South African state had few scruples when it came to plundering the elephant 
and rhino populations of its neighbours33 . In north-west Namibia the situation was 
exacerbated by the context of regional warfare between South Africa, Namibia and Angola. 
This created widespread availability of firearms, often distributed by the South African 
Defence Force (SADF) to local people as a means of fostering tensions between different 
interest groups and thereby weakening the growth of effective regional and national 
opposition. Exacerbating differences between race, gender and political affiliation in the 
region, for example, the SADF distributed firearms to Herero-speaking male herders to 
prevent the predominantly Owambo South West African People's Organisation (SWAPO) 
guerillas, who were engaged in active combat against the SADF, from infiltrating the 
region and reaching the white commercial farming areas further south34. 

In other words, the ultimate causes of wildlife losses appear largely to have been beyond 
the control of local people. Nevertheless, among private conservation organisations local 
people were increasingly constructed as the locus of responsibility for protecting regional 
wildlife populations. To this end, a network of paid male 'community game guards' was 
created, appointed with the help of local headmen and oriented towards protecting the 
threatened large mammal species of concern to the then NWT. This initiative is generally 
credited with creating local empowerment and a sense of 'ownership' over wildlife35 and it 
is this 'participation' of local people which is claimed to have playe.d the major in 
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·enabling recovery ofwildlife populations during the late.1980s. Realistically, however, the 
community game guard system provided a much needed avenue for local waged 

• · · employment at a time of impoverishment. Indicative of this, and not :m .. rprisingly, 
community game guards became less effective after the mid-1980s in areas where salaries 
and rations, as well as supervision by the MET and NWT/IRDNC, were reduced36. Any 
contribution to wildlife population increases, otherwise related to improved rainfall and a 
relaxing of combat activities in the area, was basically through extending the policing and 
anti-poaching role of MET rangers. 

Following independence in 1990, the apparent success of the north-west Namibian 
community game guard system in relation to increasing populations of wildlife was 
invoked by the then Ministry of Wildlife, Conservation and Tourism (MWCT) and the 
directors ofiRDNC in the reworking of the concept of conservancies for a ' conservancy 
policy ' which included communal areas37. This extends rights to rural 'communities ' on 
communal land to benefits from locally-managed animal wildlife and to undertake tourism 
ventures38. The Nature Conservation Amendment Act of 1996 thus significantly amends 
the 197 5 Nature Conservation Ordinance by devolving proprietorship over wildlife, and 
concessionary rights over commercial tourism, to people on communal land. As detailed 
above, this is conditional on registration as a conservancy with a defined boundary and 
membership, a representative management committee, a legal constitution and a plan for 
the equitable distribution ofbenefits39. Proprietorship, however, does not constitute full 
' ownership'. Central government retains ' .. . the legal responsibility for the nation's 
wildlife ' 40 and, as reported for Salambala Conservancy in Caprivi Region, quotas for 
hunting ' . . . are worked out and awarded by the Ministry of Environment and Tourism in 
accordance with game numbers in the area' 41 . As observed elsewhere42, the ultimate power 
over animal wildlife thus remains with the state. 

The employment of male community game guards remains a component of the 
wildlife-rich emerging conservancies in Namibia's communal areas4 . Although they are 
viewed by NGOs and donors as the 'primary link' between ' communities ' and the formal 
conservation authority44, their major functions, like game guards on both protected areas 
and private conservancies, are wildlife monitoring, policing and anti-poaching. As an MET 
ranger for Opuwo District asserts ' ... around 95% of poaching cases investigated by MET 
staff were as a result of information provided by the [community] game guards ' 45 . In 
Caprivi, the role of the community game guards initiated by IRDNC for Salambala 
conservancy in Caprivi is perceived as ' .. . to create awareness about the importance of 
wildlife and the prevention ofpoaching' 46 . In Nyae Nyae it appears that the inception of 
the LIFE programme in 1994 has been accompanied by a narrowing of the focus of 
community rangers to animal wildlife, having previously monitored and generated 
information about the wide range of resources used by Ju/'hoansi 'Bushmen' in the area47. 

'Community-based conservation' elsewhere is similarly viewed as a means whereby the 
regulation of wildlife access is intensified, often in ways which impact on the livelihoods 
of ethnically-defined groups. As Marindo-Ranganai and Zaba detail for Chapoto Ward in 
the Zambezi Valley, northern Zimbabwe, the long-standing hunting activities of the 
minority Tembo-Mvura people have been 'strongly circumscribed' by the CAMPFIRE 
programme in the area 48. 

Recently, consultants for WWF have recommended that community game guards be 
equipped with firearms, suggesting that wildlife protection activities in Namibia's 
communal areas might become increasingly militarised49. Ironically, given the labguage of 
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devolving rights to resources to local 'communities', it seems that 'community-based 
conservation' has actually ushered in a.'1 intensified policing of animal wildlife in 
communal areas. E ven more serious are the potential implications of what amounts. to 
arming civil society in the name of wildlife conservation, as testified by the recent 
emergency situation in Caprivi Region, not to mention conflict situations involving 
civilians in many areas of Africa. Leach, for example, describes how a new focus among 
donors on working through local hunters' brotherhoods as wildlife custodians in West 
Africa has constructed a ' second army' of civilians: in some cases, particularly Sierra 
Leone, these 'community game guards' are also active participants and leaders in 
d . . 1 .{:. 50 evastatmg regwna war 1are . 

It has been observed that' ... similarities in institutional arrangement between the 
conservancies that have developed on freehold land and those on communal land are 
striking', with both measuring ' . .. up well against the principles for designing long lasting 
common property resource management institutions ' 51 . Given the historical evolution of 
the conservancy concept, the legacy of exploitative policies supporting state and settler 
interests, and extremely restricted access to alternative models for 'self-determination' 
among communal area inhabitants, it is hardly surprising that 'joint solutions' for the 
conservation of wildlife in communal areas have emerged which are in line with existing 
ideas of conservancies promoted by the MET. While the legislative situation may be more 
progressive than elsewhere52, continuities with past protectionist concerns are evident. 
Conservancy establishment in communal areas remains ' . .. land acquisition for 
conservation in the non-formal sense' 53 with the emphasis on instituting effective local 
protection and policing of an internationally-valued animal wildlife of large and dangerous 
mammals. As a resource, these animals constitute the mainstay of a foreign wildlife 
tourism industry built on ' game-viewing' and trophy hunting. Negotiations with outside 
investors in these activities are encouraged as the primary means for communal area 
conservancies to generate income. 'Rural development' and ' empowerment' in these 
contexts thus seem to be somewhat circumscribed: constrained to providing effective 
protection for a handful of species which are potentially harmful to local residents and their 
other economic activities; and dependent on deals struck-up with outside tourism and 
hunting operators, often outfits whose claims to capitalise on wildlife and wilderness are 
considered legitimate by agencies and individuals advising 'communities' . In this sense, 
CBNRM in practice reflects the concerns of the conservationists and environmentalists 
who have been its main protagonists. 

Claims to land, claims to wildlife: objectives and interests framing policy 
appropriation 
It is asserted that the conservancy legislation devolves ' . . . a large measure of authority, and 
responsibility over wildlife and the right to benefit from wildlife use to landholders 
themselves, both freehold and communal' 54. Simplistic observations of parallels in the 
development of conservancies on the different categories of land (see above), together with 
references to communal area residents as ' landholders', however, obscure substantial 
structural differences in relation to land distribution and rights. Specifically, that a minority 
of settler freehold farmers have inalienable rights to a major proportion of the most 
productive land in southern and central Namibia55 . As such they effectively and legally 
own the capital constituted by their land and the resources on it, including 'huntable 
game' 56. Ensuring returns on this capital is by no means dependent gaining or retaining 
membership to a conservancy. As described by Murphree5 , smalleli social 
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better able to manage themselves and their resources than large anonymous institutions: the 
complement to this is that generally the larger the land unit the better from an animal 
wildlife conservation perspective. These conditions are precisely those which pertain on 
freehold land where settler farmers have the luxury of small numbers of people to support 
from land areas substantially larger per person, and in many cases less marginal in terms of 
productivity, than in the communal areas58. 

This context of gross inequality of land distribution has fuelled local appropriation of 
conservancies in communal areas as the only existing forum in which claims to land can be 
made and contested, and access to land and resources permitted or denied. From the outset, 
therefore, local meetings to translate the conservancy concept to communal land have been 
fraught with debate regarding claims to land rather than to wildlife. This subverting of the 
aims of CBNRM discourse has been observed elsewhere. Taylor, for example, describes 
how the Basarwa of Botswana framed debate around their own concerns regarding land 
rights as the basis for their cultural survival only to have this issue considered ' a 
distraction' by NRMP personnel59. In other words, and to the frustration of MET and NGO 
officials trying to accelerate the registration of conservancies, conservancy policy since its 
inception has been understood and appropriated by local people primarily as a land issue, 
and only secondarily as a wildlife management issue. 

In the Namibian context this is not surprising for three reasons. First, discussions over 
establishing conservancies have provided a primary outlet for debate regarding land 
redistribution and the possibilities for securing ancestral land claims in the context of 
speculation and optimism ushered in by an independent Namibia. Second, because two of 
the main criteria for gazetting a conservancy are that its physical boundaries60 and 
community membership be defined, the situation is treated as one of establishing rights to 
land areas even though officially a 'community' is only establishing rights to returns on 
animal wildlife in those areas61 . 
Third, and related to this, because there has been a lack of an overriding legal procedural 
basis for establishing tenure rights to land in communal areas the conservancy option has 
become the only means by which people can gain: any apparent security to land. This, 
together with a national policy context in which Namibian citizens can move to wherever 
they wish on communal land (with the unmonitored proviso that they observe the 
customary rights of existing inhabitants), seems set to raise further complications and 
insecurities regarding claims to community 'membership'62. As well as reflecting 
enthusiastic and successful marketing of the conservancy concept, particularly in some 
areas, the exponential rate at which conservancies are now being formed can be interpreted 
as an attempt on the part of communal area inhabitants to establish possibly exclusionary 
rights to land and resources in the absence of any other legitimate way of doing so. 

There are indications that this is indeed the case. For example, in Omusati Region in the 
north the Uukwaluudhi King Taapopi appears to be employing conservancy legislation as a 
means of fencing off a 40 km2 area as a Wildlife Reserve, including an area of 
neighbouring Ongandjera tribal land. While publicly claimed to be a reserve for the benefit 
of the 'community', accusations abound that it is intended to enable ' ... some highranking 
Government officials . . . to create moneyspinning lodges for themselves'63 . Given a context 
of de facto privatisation of land through illegal fencing by wealthy herders in north-central 
Namibia it is likely that these fears are not completely groundless64 . Similarly, complaints 
have arisen from Torra conservancy in north-west Namibia that' ... Sesfontein residents in 
search of emergency grazing areas were driving their ,cattle and goats into the areA .and 
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were also involved in illegal activities such as ensnaring game and poacP,ing' 65 . In this 
1• •· • case, the conservancy is invoked to legitimise powers of exclusion over land ::md resources 

·· other than animal wildlife66 . Again, the quote at the start -ofthis p3;per suggests that the 
newly-registered Sesfontein conservancy committee itself is attempting to regulate access 
to and use of land as well as of wildlife, by obstructing applications by local entrepreneurs 
for PTOs to specific sites for the purpose of establishing campsites. This is despite the fact 
that the development of a specific site as a local enterprise requires no proprietorship over 
animal wildlife67, and that conservancies currently do not give people legal rights of 
exclusion to resources other than revenue received from consumptive and non-consumptive 
uses of animal wildlife. Elsewhere, and reflecting ambiguities in how the conservancy 
policy is understood, people have been unable to use conservancy policy to ensure· that they 
retain access to resources other than wildlife. As Powell reports for Nyae Nyae (eastern 
Otjozondjupa Region), concern expressed by inhabitants ofTsumkwe regarding rights to 
cut poles and grass under the conservancy's proposed boundary definitions were dismissed 
as irrelevant by the local Wildlife Management Committee68 . 

In recognition of the importance of secure land tenure to support rights to wildlife 
resources, policy-makers in the MET as well as implementing conservation NGOs 
anticipated and hoped that ' ... the conservancy approach, even if embedded only in 
wildlife legislation, could help shape appropriate [land] tenure reform' 69 . In the National 
Land Policy tabled in 1997 it appeared that this was indeed the case. This included an 
option for ' ... legally constituted bodies and institutions to exercise joint ownership rights 
over land', implying that a community which has defined itself as a conservancy could 
register tenure rights to the land on which the conservancy is located70. The recently tabled 
Communal Land Reform Bill, however, does not appear to support this option71 . While 

the existence of conservancies registered under the Nature Conservation 
Ordinance 2, the Bill does not explicitly vest conservancies with tenure rights other than 
those set out in the Nature Conservation Ordinance, i.e. to wildlife and wildlife-related 
revenues. Elsewhere, the Bill appears to focus on the individualisation of land-holdings: in 
the allocation of farming and residential units as customary land rights approved by the 
relevant Traditional Authorities which are to be registered ' ... in the name of the person 
[singular] to whom it was allocated' 73 ; and in the granting, by a Land Board, ofleasehold 
tenure to individual applicants74. While, in cases where an applicant applies for leasehold 
tenure within a conservancy, the Land Boards' ... must have due regard to any 
management and utilization plan framed by the conservancy committee' 75, the conservancy 
per se apparently does not constitute legal tenure over land. It remains to be seen how this 
essentially individualising land policy trajectory will affect the escablishing and 
maintenance of 'community-held' communal area conservancies. 

Diversification of incomes will improve livelihood sustainability 
Community-based conservation and community-based tourism, particularly if shaped in 
Namibia by the establishment of communal area conservancies, is generally considered a 
valuable means of improving 'livelihood sustainability'. There are two stages to the logic. 
First, revenue from consumptive and non-consumptive uses of wildlife will enhance 
livelihoods by diversifying sources of income. Second, that this will be sustainable for two 
reasons: because tourism, worldwide and in Namibia, is currently a growth industry76; and 
because ' [ o ]nee income is derived by local communities from the use of wildlife, they 
develop a vested interest in conserving game animals' 77 , whereby environmental 
degradation, in terms of maintaining biodiversity and habitat integrity, is reduced' . . CBNRM 
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thus relies on an economising framework in which cost-benefit analyses based on monetary 
values drive the justification of projects and policy based on the ' sustainable use of natural 
resources' 78 . I wish to be realistic here about several issues with respect to assumptions 
constituting this framework. 

First, it is highly unlikely that revenue from wildlife and/or tourism will ever constitute a 
particularly large source of income for all members of a ' community' at household and 
individuallevels79 . This is without projected increases in rural (human) populations80. 

Again, this reflects a structural situation whereby population densities throughout the 
communal areas are generally higher than in the commercial farming areas, in some areas 
by an order of magnitude, so per capita average benefits are likely to only ever be much 
lower. Table 1 summarises available information for actual and potential per capita income 
from the consumptive and non-consumptive uses of wildlife for different communally-
managed areas of Namibia. Some points are worth drawing attention to. For example, 
actual and projected per capita income is low in all cases, even though these figures are 
drawn from regions which have substantial wildlife resources and where a handful of 
Namibian 'five-star conservancies' 81 have been the recipients of several years ' NGO 
support and funding. In Table 1, the highest recent armual per capita income appears to be 
approximately N$254 or £25 82, with the next highest at N$85 or £8.50. A comparison with 
the monthly old age pension ofN$160 received from the state provides an idea of the 
relatively small annual contribution this will make to household income83 . As Callihan 
states, most of the benefits received by members of communal area conservancies will 
continue to be ' .. . in the form of employment income from tourism lodges and hunting 
contracts, or from an increased level of economic activity in the area, ... rather than as a 
result of the distribution of net conservancy income' 84 . Also misleading is the use of 
surrogate monetary values for resources consumed directly by local people, which enhance 
the economic returns received by people through conservation. For example, the figure of 
US$25,000 calculated for the value of meat consumed in Kunene Region in 199385 might 
be considered somewhat spurious considering the marmer in which local people have been 
alienated from the consumption of 'bushmeat' throughout this century and criminalised 
should they hunt for own use. One could say that the 1993 hunting season instead 
'allowed' local residents to utilise resources which formerly they would have considered 
theirs to consume. 

CBNRM discourse often goes further than simply arguing that incomes from wildlife and 
tourism can diversify livelihoods. It many instances it is suggested that returns on wildlife 
will actually encourage people to disinvest in other means of livelihood, particularly 
livestock and cultivation, thereby reducing the ' degrading ' effects of these forms ofland-
use while sustaining incomes86 . For north-west Namibia Hulme and Murphree87, for 
example, maintain that ' ... the economic incentives created by devolving proprietorship 
over wildlife and tourism have led to people in this area re-evaluating the relative roles of 
wildlife and agriculture (domestic livestock and crops) in local development'. However, if 
per capita incomes from community-based wildlife and tourism initiatives remain as low as 
they are now, and even without cultural influences over choices of subsistence, it is highly 
unlikely that people will view this as an alternative to their usual means of livelihood. 
Instead, it might be anticipated that people will direct any income received from 
community-based conservation projects towards sources of income over which they have 
direct control and ownership, and via which they are more likely to raise their individual 
material standards of living. 
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This is precisely what has been observed by M_urombedzi for CAMPFIRE in Zimbabwe 
where people have invested income received from CAMPFIRE in livestock and 
cultivation88, forms of land-use otherwise framed negatively as degrading by 
conservationists. Similarly, in Caprivi (north-east Namibia), income received from IRDNC 
by community game guards has been documented as used to hire oxen or a tractor for the 
ploughing of fields: as well as 'degrading' wildlife habitat by expanding the amount of 
land put under cultivation, gender analysis demonstrates this to increase the amount of 
agricultural work, namely weeding and harvesting, done by women while men's labour is 
effectively subsidised through their eamings89. In Torra conservancy, southern Kunene 
Region, rights to manage animal wildlife are apparently seen very much in terms of aiding 
livestock productivity. As Jones elaborates, a member of the Torra conservancy committee 
told him ' .. . that gaining rights over wildlife meant that the community could now manage 
its livestock properly. Although the community was conserving its wildlife [i.e. their use of 
it was illegal] , a build up of numbers meant that game animals were competing with 
livestock for browse and grazing. In the past, the community could reduce its livestock but 
not its wildlife. Now they would be able to achieve a balance between the two' 90. In other 
words, it seems that while initiators and implementers of CBNRM schemes are banking on 
diversification of incomes and some degree of infrastructural underdevelopment to keep 
wildlife and wilderness intact, the recipients of these schemes are transforming them into 
pathways for intensification of land-use. Not surprisingly, their priorities as individuals and 
householders, in part at least, lie in providing for growing populations and for achieving 
higher expectations with respect to acquiring the commodities of modem-living. 

Further, while some communal areas ofNamibia appear ideal for enhancing livelihood 
opportunities through capitalising on animal wildlife this is by no means evenly distributed. 
Kunene Region in north-west Namibia, for example, is characterised by diverse 
landscapes, a spectacular wildlife of large mammals, and relatively low human population 
densities. Under donor-led framings of community-based conservation, these constitute 
perfect conditions for the evolution of so-called ' 5-star conservancies ' 91 . Not surprisingly, 
therefore, this area has been a focus ofNGO and donor support for the establishment of 
conservancies: 3 out of 5 registered conservancies, and several immediately planned 
conservancies are located in this region92 . Critique is particularly unwelcome in this 
context because these circumstances appear so ripe for ' success' . At the same time, widely 
publicised elaborations of success based on these situations, present a rather unrealistic 
picture of the possibilities for the national conservancy policy to improve livelihoods in the 
country's communal areas as a whole. Areas of north-central Namibia, for example, with 
high human population densities and little animal wildlife or 'wild' landscapes, present 
limited opportunities for wildlife-based tourism to contribute to rural development and 
livelihood sustainability. 

The above suggest some serious constraints on the ability of community-based wildlife 
conservation to significantly contribute to people's livelihoods in communal areas93 . What 
is also obscured by the rhetoric of participation, empowerment and benefits defining 
'community-based' projects are the very real concerns which exist at national level to 
increase user-accountability for the costs of maintaining public sector services in remote 
and difficult environments. This is extremely clear in the context of water provision for 
which a community-based system of water-point committees is being advocated ostensibly 
as a means of empowering communal area farmers, but basically by encouraging their 
participation in funding and maintaining boreholes94. Community conservation of wildlife 
similarly involves the shifting of costs and responsibilities to the. loyal level: in the policing 
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of people ' s activities in relation to wildlife; in the-funding of cornmunity institutions 
designed to manage wildlife and related revenues; and in the day-to-day experience of 
living with large and sometimes dangerous mammals95. Not content\¥ith shifting 
responsibilities only within the wildlife sector, and as occurs in some CAMPFIRE areas of 
Zimbabwe96, MET and IRDNC employees have also argued that revenue accruing to 
conservancies from wildlife could be mobilised to fund other sectoral developments such 
as school-building97 . 

Available figures for the income that is or might be received from wildlife and tourism via 
conservancies make no provision for the costs involved in running conservancies. As 
Durbin, Jones and Murphree state, and in accordance with the USAID' s LIFE programme 
objective that at least five conservancies will become self-sustaining by 20029 , the ' .. . 
expectation is that conservancies, once financially viable, will take on the payment of the 
game guards, some of the staff and equipment such as vehicles and/or radios required to 
support them' 99. To date these have been paid for by NGOs via the major donor-funded 
national CBNRM programme (LIFE); for which a staggering US$25 million has been 
received from 1993-2000100 of which US$14 million has been channelled to IRDNC 
between 1992 and 1999101 . It is envisaged that the running costs of conservancies will be 
transferred to the new conservancy institutions as, to paraphrase Jones, communities are 
able to 'wean' themselves offNGO support102 (see also Durbin et al. , 1997). It is entirely 
probable, however, that very little income will remain after the running costs of the 
conservancies have been covered. As reported in Callihan, the LIFE programme estimates 
that US$28,000 per year are required to run a conservancy while average income will be 
around US$28,600 plus wages accruing to individuals working for wildlife-related tourism 
ventures 103 . This amounts logically to a situation whereby the community conservancy 
finances the costs of conserving an animal wildlife accessed and valued by predominantly 
white conservationists, ecotourists and trophy hunters, while receiving very little additional 
income for its efforts. The phasing out of donor-funding thus raises significant questions 
regarding the ' sustainability' and, importantly, the development claims, of these 
conservation ventures. 

Confronting the above can only reveal communal-area conservancies as a fine-tuning of 
resource management arrangements which in no way challenges an existing status quo of 
structural inequity in the distribution of capital (i.e. land and natural resources) 104. 

Moreover, and as summarised by Gaisford, global trends regarding ecotourism and 
community-based tourism indicate limitations and threats to the sustainability of this 
source ofrevenue 105 . For example: some 50% of tourism income leaks back to developed 
countries via foreign airlines, tour operators and investors; by creating inflation in local 
prices local people are effectively excluded as investors and consumers; local employment 
opportunities are often limited to unskilled, low income positions; and tourism demands, 
reflecting income sustainability, fluctuate, particularly in relation to regional political 
instability106. The latter point is forcefully brought home by the recent emergency situation 
in Caprivi Region, a focus of conservancy developments, which appears to be fuelling 
cancellations by tourists to the area and to Namibia in general 107 . 

Participation, representation, empowerment - and inequality 
Community-based approaches to conservation are generally credited with providing an 
enabling context for the development of democratic and empowering local institutions for 
decision-making regarding natural resources108 . One ofthe legal requirements 
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· Namibian conservancy legislation, in fact, is that the committee representing the 
community is democratically elected. A second claim is that arriving at the idea of 
communal areas conservancies was a participatory process, involving a consultative 
approach which encompassed the wider community109. While running the risk of nihilism, 
I wish in this section to introduce some alternative perspectives and 'evidence' which 
suggests an 'on-the-ground' reality somewhat in conflict with these claims. This again 
raises questions about the sustainability of a donor-led communalising development 
agenda, which requires assertions of participation, representation and empowerment as 
measures of the success of the projects and programmes it supports. 

The initiation of dialogue with rural 'communities' regarding wildlife conservation in 
communal areas in a post-independent Namibia began with the conducting of several 
' socioecological' surveys by the MET. Following Jones, these are generally credited with 
assessing the attitudes of communal area residents to wildlife, identifying problems and 
seeking joint solutions110 . As Jones states, ' [t]he conservancy approach was not imposed 
from outside, but developed from a joint recognition of problems and solutions between 
communities, government and N GOs' lll. I have already traced the evolution of the 
conservancy model in Namibia and I suggest that it is unsurprising that it has become 
prevalent because communities did not have access to alternative models. As Powell claims 
regarding the activities of the LIFE programme in Nyae Nyae, ' . .. the participatory process 
that LIFE advocates appears to only enable the community to participate at the level of 
implementation, and not within the domains of program design or planning' , which are led 
instead by established ideas for wildlife conservation 112. What is also apparent from 
follow-up surveys is first, that initial meetings regarding communal area conservancies 
took place with individuals who were not necessarily representative of the wider 
community and second, that there was little accessibility of the issues discussed to the 
diverse range of residents comprising 'communities'. 

For example, in 1994 a two-week ' socioecological' survey of southern Kunene region was 
conducted to introduce the idea of establishing locally-managed conservancies to rural 
communities. One of the initial meetings comprising this survey took place in Sesfontein, a 
relatively large settlement in southern Kunene Region. Shortly after this, I interviewed 
people from some 20% of 'households' in the settlement. Of the 28 individual and small-
group discussions no adults had attended the public meeting. In fact, the vast majority did 
not even know that the meeting took place and certainly did not realise that they had a right 
to attend and contribute to discussion. This survey was of primarily Damara-speaking 
people, the major language group in an area otherwise shared with Herero-speakers plus 
some Nama and Owambo people. Otherwise it included men and women, young and old, 
and rich and poor. What is significant about the survey is that it suggests that the then 
Development Committee of Sesfontein, in whom the MET had vested responsibility for 
informing the wider community of the meeting, had not fulfilled this responsibility11 3 . 

Echoing recent local criticism of the composition of the Sesfontein conservancy committee 
(see introduction), it is now acknowledged that ' ... people chosen as IRDNC staff [in 
Kunene] were often also chosen for office in committees' 114. This blatantly compromises 
the legality of such committees, given the requirement of the conservancy legislation that 
each conservancy member should have a say in electing the committee. As observed 
elsewhere, when individuals are selected to serve on new committees by established 
authorities such as the traditional leadership, government departments or NGOs, there is a 
high likelihood that they will not be representative of the full diversity of community 
interests 115 . 
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Similar problems with the representativeness of community institutions have been 
identified with regard to the Nyae Nyae Farmers' Cooperative (NNFC) in Eastern 
Tsurnkwe District (formerly Bushmanland) and the wider Ju/'hoan San community. Jones 
concludes that, after some five years of pursuing activities framed specifically as CBNRM 
in this area, ' . .. there has not yet emerged a community institution which has been able to 
fully integrate the interests and activities of other community institutions' existing from 
local to district levels116. Importantly, this was primarily because,' . . . while the 
government and NGOs were legitimising the NNFC by working through it and 
strengthening it, its legitimacy within the community was far less strong than was realised 
by many outsiders' 11 7. As detailed by Gaisford the NNFC is criticised locally for acting in 
the interests of its representatives while compromising the possibilities for benefits to be 
received by communities who do not support this institution118. Similarly, people affected 
by the 'proto-conservancy' ofUukwaluudhi in Omusati Region, north-central Namibia, 
have protested to the national press that they were not consulted about decisions which 
affect their access to land and rights as community members. As Shivute reports, 
'Uukwaluudhi residents unhappy about the creation of the wildlife conservancy descended 
on The Namibian' s office in Oshakati to complain that the . .. plan [to fence offland as part 
of the Uukwaluudhi Wildlife Reserve] had been "one-sided". They claim that many 
residents had not been informed what was afoot' 119. 

These experiences suggest that, while relying on local institutions is a more than justifiable 
position, this is by no means a guarantee that ' community-based' 'joint solutions' have 
been reached in a consultative and representative manner. Making claims to this effect, 
however, conveniently side-steps the importance of evaluating the process in 
communication with the range of individuals comprising 'communities' in the broadest 
sense 120. Further, suggesting that Western democratic elective models may be inappropriate 
in relation to certain 'cultural norms' 121 , seems to justify the lack of engagement with 
encouraging and monitoring possibilities for wide representation in decision-making and 
elections. 

The above begins to illustrate ways in which a communalising discourse by necessity 
moulds heterogeneous social groupings into an abstract categorisation of homogeneous 
'communities' . As such, and as I have argued elsewhere122, contemporary ' community-
based' approaches to conservation and development trace a direct lineage to colonial 
tendencies to perceive the rural African 'other' in terms of undifferentiated groupings 
which were conceptually easier both to administer and to maintain in structural positions of 
disadvantage. In this sense, like the colonial and conventional ethnographic application of 
the term 'tribe' , the term 'community' is opaque and misleading, obscuring social, 
economic, cultural and gendered differences in access to, and symbolic associations with, 
natural resources. 

Recent analyses are revealing a number of instances where axes of shared differences are 
actually exacerbated in CBNRM initiatives, despite their stated focus on equality, 
representation and empowerment123 . If some groups are marginalised despite the inclusive 
rhetoric of 'community-based natural resources management' then an important issue 
becomes how to enhance a context for dialogue and negotiation which is more empowering 
to those groups. The first step might be a commitment to exploring what it is about the 
economic and symbolic relationships people have, or are perceived to have, with the wider 
landscape that structures either the occlusion or the elevation ofpru;ticular group5 in 
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-· ,,. CBNRM initiatives. If ' ... livelihoods are not just about subsistence but also represent 
notions of identity and provide continuity with the past' 124, then implementers ofCBNRM 
programmes could do well to engage with these symbolic complexities as a strategy to 
meet aims of both empowerment and livelihood sustainability. 

An obvious issue is the way in which conservation projects in southern Africa revolve 
around a limited wildlife of large mammals which is inextricable from constructions of a 
white South African masculine identity linked economically and psychologically to 
hunting 125 . Historically and today, amongst European and African societies, women have 
been the 'decorative fringe' to men as hunters and conservationists such that they are 
conceptually, and sometimes literally, excluded from discussion. Monbiot makes the 
gendered associations underlying wildlife use and management rather more explicit than 
most in his critique of Zimbabwe's CAMPFIRE programme that 'Campfire has little to do 
with the welfare of poor Zimbabweans. It has little to do with conserving wildlife. It has 
everything to do with servicing the perverse and lucrative fantasies of a bunch of American 
gun fanatics who have something missing in the trousers department' 126. Given that 
gendered associations with environment and wildlife are so strong, conferring 'distinct 
relations of disadvantage' for women127, it is perhaps surprising that they are afforded so 
little attention in wider CBNRM discourse. 

A number of reported incidents suggest that these associations have conferred a less than 
enabling context for the participation of women in community-based conservation in 
Namibia. At the final workshop of the 1994 southern Kunene 'socioecological survey', for 
example, all Damara and Herero women who attended the meeting were physically 
excluded from participating by being obliged to sit outside the shelter in which the meeting 
was held 128 . This was justified by the MET convenors of the meeting on the strength that 
they were working within the constraints of the (male) traditional leadership.· 
Notwithstanding the extent to which current forms of this traditional leadership are a 
construction ofNamibia's colonial history129, this is somewhat ironic given that the whole 
purpose of the meeting was to try and begin a process of new institution-building, enabling 
better representation and participation in the decentralisation of decision-making power130. 

Nabane also details the consolidation of male decision-making power in negotiations 
between an all men group of village representatives, traditional leadership and a lodge 
manager over establishing a 'community' campsite at Lianshulu Village- an initiative 
which, until women's opinions were explicitly sought, actually seemed set to constrain 
access to 'critical' riverine plant resources collected by women in the course of generating 
household livelihoods131 . Gaisford similarly notes that among the Ju/'hoansi, a people 
otherwise constructed as egalitarian and non-hierarchical in decision-making, men have 
been at the ' ... forefront of interactions with officials and outsiders as the representatives 
of the people' 132. As elsewhere133, current emphases on encouraging trophy hunting in 
communal area conservancies as a means of generating the highest monetary returns on 
wildlife resources 134, despite previous considerations that non-consumptive uses are more 
appropriate in the Namibian, and particularly the Kunene, context135, might be expected to 
increase these differences in access to dialogue and decision-making. At the same time, 
conservation success in terms of increasing animal wildlife populations conflicts directly 
with women's responsibilities as cultivators and resource-gatherers by raising the 
likelihood of damage to crops and exacerbating the dangers of travelling away from 
homesteads to collect valued non-timber items 136. 
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Namibia's LIFE project is forging attempts to specifically involve women in CBNRM 
initiatives, through the employment ofwomen·by IRDNC as ' community resource 
monitors '· ', .. to better exploit natural resource management opportunities and to facilitate 
the flow of information' regarding resource management issues 137. Unqualified claims for 
h f ' . 138 1 . h . t e success o women s activators eave open questwns as to w at extent women are 

integrated into existing conservancy committees, and whether an accentuation of difference 
compromises the contribution of women to male domains of decision-making 139. Fieldwork 
in southern Kunene Region in early 1999 elicited some perhaps illuminating responses 
when asking women about conservancies. For example, IHairo, an elderly woman in 
Sesfontein stated that ' [ o ]nly women are here, there are no men at these houses' , meaning 
that she did not know anything about the conservancy in her area because it was effectively 
'men's business'. Similarly, when I asked Habuhege, a middle-aged woman at Ani:;egab, 
!U:;egab River, about conservancies she immediately turned to her partner and urged him to 
speak instead of her, despite being the primary speaker throughout the interview on issues 
ranging from resource-use practices to perceptions of environmental degradation. 

A second question regards the influence of ethnicity in conceptions of, and claims to, land, 
resources and decision-making power. The significance of ethnicity in development 
debates is a hoary issue. This is especially so in a context such as Namibia, where a 
unifying ideology of nation-building has been so important in structuring a 'struggle for 
independence' from the 'divide and rule' policies of an apartheid administration. The 
reification by the state of static ethnic categories imagined by a missionary and colonial 
ethnography' s ' . . . excessive preoccupation with ethnicity and cultural distinctiveness' 140 

further contributes to a shying away from the implications of ethnic differences 141 • In 
considerations of representation in local-level institutions, and in understanding issues 
infusing use of, and competing claims to, natural resources, however, ethnicity becomes a 
crucial axis of difference. Particularly important is a recognition that in areas of historically 
overlapping and contested claims to land it tends to be the same groups who are 
marginalised from decision-making on account of both culturally-influenced associations 
with resources, and perceptions of these associations by others. 

As Taylor observes for the Botswanan context, despite ' [ o ]ffical discourses of sameness' 
de facto prejudices along ethnic lines exist and emerge in national policy and its enactment 
at locallevels 142. The Tembo-Mvura of northern Zimbabwe, for example, imaged 
derogatorily in the national press as' ... a backward community of two-toed people' , have 
experienced a constant diversion to locally powerful Chikunda people of resources and 
revenue generated under national programmes, including CAMPFIRE143 . The politics of 
difference seems to be particularly consistent when considering the 'Bushmen' peoples of 
southern Africa. For the 'Bushmen', their constructed status as ' Stone Age ' 'creatures of 
the veld' with no social history of tenure relationships to land144 compromises their chances 
for engaging with a modem state-led CBNRM discourse in a way which affirms their 
rights to land. Such rights are crucial as the symbolic and economic foundation underlying 
both cultural identity and livelihoods145. A recent newspaper article detailing the death of 
five Kxoe Bushmen due to starvation in western Caprivi, however, epitomises continuing 
discriminatory perceptions in the statement by an unnamed government official that ' [t]o 
them it is a natural thing that at this time of year people should die ofhunger' 146. In other 
words, they remain constructed as people 'of nature' who are still governed by unmediated 
natural forces: a view which completely discounts their history of marginalisation from 
land and official discourses and the contribution of these to instances of starvation in a 
contemporary context. In Namibia, historic constructions of the Damara as ' culuh;1lly 

16 



hunter-gatherers' without formal conceptions of land tenure147 also have compromised 
theirpossibilities for legitimising claims to land, particularly in relation to an ascendant 
and wealthy Herero cattle pastoralism. For the Bushmen, the situation is further 
exacerbated by their apparently egalitarian and non-hierarchical distribution of power. 
While this should be perfect in terms of intra-community decision-making which matches 
the communalising ideals of community-based conservation, it is proving a major 
drawback in interactions and negotiations with outsiders such as government, established 
pastoralists and, in the Namibian case, repatriated Herero people148. 

Ethnicity and its constructions thus draw out continuing symbolic associations people have 
with the landscape and emphasises the significance of these in constructions and 
rationalisations of exclusion149. Land-use mapping by different groups can reveal 
substantial variations in requirements for access to significant resources and places, and 
can go some way, perhaps, to empowering counter-claims to land and resources150. For 
example, in north-west Namibia some Damara people travel substantial distances to gather 
specific resources and many trace ancestral associations in the wider landscape to areas far 
afield from current settlement locales151 . As has been pointed out to me, if these are 
important to people in the establishment of conservancy boundaries then they will come up 
in debate regarding where these boundaries are established152. But if the conservancy 
committee is not representative of these wider issues and practices of resource use and 
landscape history, then it is highly unlikely that they will feature in boundary debates. The 
probable outcome of such a situation is that individuals will procure resources much as 
they have always done, across boundaries not of their choosing and into areas where 
restrictions may be operative, because these practices remain important in affirming 'who 
they are'. As long as collectors avoid large mammals, it is unlikely that anyone will take 
much notice: but one could hardly describe this as a situation which empowers people's 
diverse interests in land and natural resources. 

Conclusion: 'Donor assistance has been significant, but donor agendas have not 
dominated ' 153 

Jones concludes a recent review of CBNRM in Namibia with the exhortation to ' ... beware 
the dominance of donors and the arrogance of academia in trying to categorise and judge 
the lives of rural Africans and the work of the people at the coalface of conservation' 154. 

Inappropriate mining metaphors aside, this seems to completely miss the point that it is 
donors who are driving a dominant communalising discourse - arrogant in its 
categorisation and homogenisation of diverse groupings of people - which is uncritically 
upheld and maintained in Jones' various reviews. Further, given that most evaluation of 
CBNRM projects is donor-led and written by a relatively small, self-referring group of 
consultants, who in many cases are intimately involved with the formulation and 
implementation of national CBNRM programmes, it would appear that academic research 
actually has a crucial role to play- particularly in problematising criteria for reckoning the 
'success' of projects, and in highlighting issues of representation and revealing alternative 
perspectives. Interestingly, much of a communalising development discourse is 
being led by scholars from the south15 . Academic, actor-oriented research is a route 
whereby long-term and detailed work, exploring local diversity and multiple voices, can 
make explicit contradictions and tensions between an essentialising ideology of 
' community' and local aspirations and differences. Contrary to Jones ' accusations of 
academic categorisation of rural Africans, a relativist and poststructuralist social 
anthropology today is so concerned with not essentialising categoriys that in some 
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instances it could be likened more to individual psychology: to an explicit focus on how 
one's·own suoject"position is constructed and maintained through relationships with the · 
'other' offieldwork156 . Be that as it may, a major challenge facing academic researches of 
environment and development which reveal alternative and occluded narratives is an · 
embracing of the responsibility to make these researches available and accessible to 
national and international policy discourses157. 

As Matenga points out, the gloss of participatory success in the marketing of southern 
African CBNRM programmes makes it rather hard to criticise the famed and 
'outstanding ' 158 community conservation projects of the region159. Clearly, it is preferable 
that local people benefit from the animal wildlife with which they live instead of remaining 
alienated from these resources in a 'fortress conservation' of the colonial past. But 
underneath the rhetoric, ' community-based conservation' is not the radically and 
qualitatively different approach to conservation that it claims to be. As Escobar argues, it 
seems that the language of emancipation and democratisation is inseparable from a 
northern modernising development discourse which asserts conformity and control through 
donor-funding to the countries of 'the south' 160. In the case of conservation, a cavalier 
coinage of the term 'community' is a means of extending the modernising agenda of the 
so-called 'Washington consensus' 161 of the World bank and International Monetary Fund, 
via the various international conventions relating to environment and development and via 
implementing agencies such as WWF-US and USAID. Through this 'communities' , as 
depoliticised and undifferentiated entities, ' . . . are finally recognized as the owners of their 
territories (or what is left of them), but only to the extent that they accept seeing and 
treating territory and themselves as reservoirs of In the case of conservation in 
Africa, this means that support is only available to ' communities ' to the extent that they 
agree to construct themselves as ' suitable' custodians of internationally-valued 
biodiversity, particularly animal wildlife. 

A middle-class of 'the developed world', collectively the ' virtual consumers' 163 of an 
exotic and spectacularly imaged fauna of ' the south' , appears concerned about the pending 
loss of a ' global resource ' ofwildlife and 'wilderness ' . While now stressing that local 
people should benefit from this wildlife, a number of perhaps unrealistic, and generally 
unvoiced, expectations remain. First, that African communal area residents should continue 
to live with a sometimes dangerous wildlife on 'their' land. Second, that efforts should be 
made to foster the increase of populations of these same dangerous, but threatened, species. 
Third, that this should occur over and above investment in alternative sources of livelihood. 
Fourth, that, as donor-funding is phased out, revenue received from conservation efforts 
should be used to finance newly created communal-area wildlife management institutions. 
Fifth, that a primary responsibility of these institutions, as Patel points out164, should be the 
negotiation of business agreements which allow private safari operators continued access to 
the wildlife resources on which their profits depend. 

Is it really reasonable to expect that a structurally entrenched rural poor should continue to 
service the fantasies of African wilderness projected by predominantly expatriate 
environmentalists, conservationists, tourists and trophy hunters? Or that a communalising 
discourse equating rural development and ' empowerment' with wildlife preservation and 
foreign tourism will be ' sustainable', given both the constraints it imposes on individual 
aspiration and the dissatisfaction it produces in people who feel excluded? It seems that 
'sustainable development' and 'community-based conservation' only work if it is assumed 
that large proportions of the world' s population will be content wit}). remaining pvor. If the 
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wealthy ofthe world wish to retain an ideal of African wildlife and :wild' landscapes<then 
perhaps we should put our money where ,our collective mouth is: through up-front payment 
for the service of maintaining wildlife In Europe, and under certain conditions, we · · · 
manipulate land-use through the payment of economically realistic subsidies to individual 
farmers 166. In some cases this includes 'setting aside' land rather than working or · 
converting it to alternative uses. If conservation boils down to economic incentives then, I 
would suggest, it will be ' sustainable ' only if accompanied by a 'consumer pays' approach 
which is honest about the distribution of both interests in, and the costs of, wildlife 
conservation. This implies nothing short of a secure commitment to substantial and long-
term (upwards of several decades) international subsidies directly to local land-users, of 
amounts realistic enough to compensate for the opportunity costs of not converting either 
land to alternative uses or large mammals to cash. Failing this, it seems logical that 
policing and law enforcement, whether by government officials, NGO employees or 
community game guards, will remain the foundation on which preservation of an 
internationally-valued animal wildlife depends. So, what else is 'new'? 
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Captions 
Table 1. Income received and projected for communal areas from both consumptive and 
non-consumptive uses of wildlife. Question marks indicate an approximate figure for 
number of individuals in the area referred to, extrapolated from 1991 census figures for 
average household size for the Region. N$ = Namibian dollars (currently N$6.12 and 
N$10.12 to US$1 and £1 respectively); n =numbers of individuals in area; N$/cap.a-l = 
Namibian dollars per capita per year. Sources are: Central Statistics Office, 1991 
population and housing census (Windhoek, Central Statistics Office, National Planning 
Commission, 1994), pp. 11, 16; C. Ashley, 'Tourism, Communities, and the Potential 
Impacts on Local Incomes and Conservation' , DEA Research Discussion Paper 10 
(Windhoek, Directorate of Environmental Affairs, Ministry ofEnvironment and Tourism, 
1995), pp. 12, 17, 19; J.I. Bames, ' Current and Potential Use Values for Natural Resources 
in Some Namibian Communal Areas: a Planning Tool' , DEA Working Paper (Windhoek, 
Directorate of Environmental Affairs, Ministry of Environment and Tourism, 1995); 
B.T.B. Jones, ' Wildlife Management, Utilization and Tourism in Communal Areas: 
Benefits to Communities an Improved Resource Management', DEA Research Discussion 
Paper 5 (Windhoek, Directorate ofEnvironmental Affairs, Ministry of Environment, 
1995), p. 9; C. Inambao, 'Light at the End of Conservancy Tunnel', The Namibian (March 
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Eden Working Paper 2. (London, International Institute for Environment and Development 
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Eden Series Discussion Paper 6. (London, International Institute for Environment and 
Development (liED), 1999), p. 78-79; The Namibian, 'Residents Celebrate new Salambala 
Conservancy', The Namibian (January 25, 1999). 

Figure 1. Map of Namibia showing new regional boundaries, regional populations sizes, 
and approximate locations of gazetted and some proposed conservancies in communal 
areas (details in italics). Sources are: Central Statistics Office, 1991 population and 
housing census (Windhoek, Central Statistics Office, National Planning Commission, 
1994); MET Some facts andfigures about communal area conservancies (Windhoek, 
Ministry of Environment and Tourism, 1998); C. Maletsky, 'Himba seize initiative', The 
Namibian (June 4, 1998); C. Maletsky, 'Himbas in conservancy move', The Namibian 
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i' 

_Y_e_a_r ____ ______ JLn ______ LJN __ ____ 
non-consumptive uses: 
1993 25,000 ? ? Received by Puros community from tourists over 2-3 

1994 26,000 3581? 
years. ---7j_-6 _________ ___ ______ 
5 neighbouring villages (comprising 746 households 
with an average of 4.8 people per household in 
Caprivi Region). 

1994 -- --2;2"oo;·o-o-o·------i"J"o-;o-o-o-·-- ---EJ":<ii _____ --- ----- --Esi"ill-iateCi"i"oc-arillc:o-ffiedrom--iolirl"s-ffi;-p-r:;ma:ray 

1994 

wages from private sector and government 
operations (very unevenly distributed), but also from 
local enterprises such as craft production, for the 
communal areas of Caprivi (excluding the urban 
centre of Katima Mulilo ), former 'Damaraland', 
Opuwo District and former 'Bushmanland'. ---- -··r·s···--- ----- ----------___ rroJectea·----- ------------ -----·----------- -- ----- ----·------------ --"3-s·--------------------- --tolifl"s_ffi_illcome--av-erag-es-across--caiJil¥-c·-------·------------- ----

Cin 1995) --T996 _______ _ 4o,"ooo·---------- --ir;:s·oo-·----- -- ---ir:s"ii ____ ---------- --B-eifii"Iglidevl"es c-ollecie-cfby--Eieiieiei<a"Moliiliaill 
Camp and distributed to 5 neighbouring communities 
in southern Kunene Region. ---T998 ____ __ ___________ --2-ro;ooo·------- ---5-52"? ____ ------ ---2-s"J:-62" _____ ___ ___ -"Iii_c_ome-r:ece-lveCi-i:J:Y--txo·lioliseiioiCis-(wltii--aii--averaiie __ _ 

1999 

of 4.6 per household for Kunene Region) over 18 
months by Torra Conservancy, southern Kunene 
Region, from joint business venture with 
Damaraland Camp (run by Wilderness Safaris). 

2, ooo ---- -- -;i;ooo·----- --- ··o-:2"9 ----- ------ ---- caffii)s"Iie--earnings to:r-·sa:tamiJaia-coilservancy, 
Caprivi. 

consumptive: 
1993 150,000 3,000 50 Consumption ofUS$25,000 worth of meat, as 

calculated by IRDNC, in the 1993 hunting season by 
communities in Sesfontein and Bergsig, Kunene 
Region .. ---T99:r ------------ ---is;iso·---------- --J;ooo-·-------- ---4-.-<Ys--·------------- -- ··sare-of"Sk"ills--aft"eiT99"3"liilli.tillg--seasoii-;-ill--s-estoilie_ill __ 
and Bergsig areas, Kunene Region with N$6,000 
recouped by IRDNC to cover ammunition costs. 
IRDNC estimated that transport costs amounted to a 
further N$1 0,000. 

----····················- ------------- -- ------- --- ---····-································-··- ······-····-··-·-·-··-··-----------------------·-------------- ----------------------------·------------------·----
1995 150,000+ 3,000 50 Rough estimate for value of meat consumed in 

Sesfontein and Bergsig areas, Kunene Region, in 
1995 hunting season. 

1995 13,000 3,000 4.33 Sale of skins after 1995 hunting season in Sesfontein 
and Bergsig areas, Kunene Region. Nb. assisted by 
IRDNC at a cost ofN$23,000. 

1999 & 180,000 7,000 12.86 Two-year hunting concession negotiated by 
2000 Salambala Conservancy, Caprivi Region. 

---T999 _____ - ------- --900---------------- - --7-; ooo·-- -----oj"J"-- ------- ---- -liicoffie-ti--c;!ii-tr:oiJii:Y-liiilii"lii_g __ c;r-r;;ra·s-Tor-saEiiiiJala ______ _ 
Conservancy, Caprivi Region. ----1999_&_ ------- ---i1o;ooo·------- ---2";oo<Y _________ ---42":5·----------------- --Fee--tor-ililliilii-i--Ciiiota-iiiailieei-io-Lii"R:o-cheire··------------------

2ooo Hunting and Guest Farm by the Nyae Nyae 
Conservancy, eastern Otjozondjupa Region, to be 
paid in 2 instalments over 2 years. 

mitiatiVes combmmg consumptive and non-consumptive uses: 
projected 1,800,000 33,000 54.55 Projected potential income from wildlife and tourism 
(in 1995) in former Damaraland with all concessions as joint 

ventures, i.e. though establishment of conservancies 
to gain concessionary rights. Assuming that up-
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"· ,/;# f 
" l 'f_ 

T999& J no,ooo 2;ooo 4z.s 
2000 

market lodges pay N$40,00o•-t and hunting 
concessions pay N$30,000 a-t_ ··· ·vailie-·aiiillsiie.cHted···aJier.benefits;··i·a·Nyae .. Nyae· 
Conservancy, eastern Otjozondjupa Region, from La · 
Rochelle Hunting and Guest Farm. 

1999 & 
2000 

16o;ooo········ ···i;ooa·········· ··"Lro······················ ··variie .. aire.stodd.llg.Nyae .. N.ya·e·c·on:s·ervancy:··eastern.··· 
Otjozondjupa Region, with oryx and red hartebeest 
by La Rochelle Hunting and Guest Farm. 
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